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Solicitation IFB 23I-1018  Due Date: October 18, 2023  Time: 3:00 p.m. 
 
 Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the 
solicitation listed above.  
 

 
I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed: 

 

Signed  __ _____________ Signed       
 
Printed Melissa Jimenez_____________ Printed         Michael Nentwig 
 
Date   _October 18, 2023_____________  Date                October 18, 2023_____________  

Vendor Contact Name Submission Date Status 
Advanced Structural Engineering, 
Inc. Karen Ratliff 

September 19, 2023 
10:23 AM No Bid 

Arrowhead Superior Refrigeration 
Se Alma Griego 

September 19, 2023 
12:04 PM No Bid 

ASSOCIATED SIGN COMPANY COREY SHANO 
October 18, 2023 

12:13 PM Submitted 

Coit Services Sean Police 
September 19, 2023 

8:25 AM No Bid 

Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles 
September 19, 2023 

8:38 AM No Bid 
DunCor, LLC dba Summit West 
Signs Dana Duncan 

October 18, 2023 
9:35 AM Submitted 

Fluoresco Services, LLC Jennifer Small 
October 18, 2023 

2:48 PM Submitted 
Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc 
dba System4 of Phoenix Susan Ricks 

September 19, 2023 
8:28 AM No Bid 

Grace Signs LLC DBA Signs Plus Rick North 
October 17, 2023 

12:54 PM Submitted 

Nippon Shokken U.S.A. Inc. Jack Kobayashi 
September 19, 2023 

9:27 AM No Bid 

Norcon Industries, Inc. Lora Harvey 
October 18, 2023 

12:45 PM Submitted 

Precise Sign Co Amanda Lauridsen 
October 18, 2023 

2:51 PM Submitted 

QCM Technologies, Inc. Patricia Paxton 
September 19, 2023 

8:36 AM No Bid 

Textbook Warehouse Patricia Walters 
September 20, 2023 

5:42 AM No Bid 



 

211 N 7th St, Kingman, AZ 86401     Phone: (928) 753-6945     Fax: (928) 718-3232     mesc.org 

EH 7/10/20 

MESC Solicitation Opening 

 
 

Solicitation Number: IFB 23I-1018 

Opening Date: October 18, 2023  Opening Time: 3:00 P.M. 

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation. 

 
Printed Name: Signature 

Melissa Jimenez 
 

Amber Elliott  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

 

Kristy Hamm 

Michael Nentwig 





ASSOCIATED SIGN COMPANY
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid

1 Market Basket Sample Job #1 Each $36,313.00 FALSE
2 Market Basket Sample Job #2 Each $238.50 FALSE
3 Market Basket Sample Job #3 Each $5,579.75 FALSE
4 Market Basket Sample Job #4 Each $1,009.80 FALSE
5 Installation Labor (Lowest Rate) Pr Hr $90.00 FALSE

DunCor, LLC dba Summit West Signs
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid

1 Market Basket Sample Job #1 Each $5,215.57 FALSE
2 Market Basket Sample Job #2 Each $17.49 FALSE
3 Market Basket Sample Job #3 Each $2,565.09 FALSE
4 Market Basket Sample Job #4 Each $403.26 FALSE
5 Installation Labor (Lowest Rate) Pr Hr $18.90 FALSE

Fluoresco Services, LLC
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid

1 Market Basket Sample Job #1 Each $43,185.08 FALSE
2 Market Basket Sample Job #2 Each $135.95 FALSE
3 Market Basket Sample Job #3 Each $143,674.88 FALSE
4 Market Basket Sample Job #4 Each $1,903.35 FALSE
5 Installation Labor (Lowest Rate) Pr Hr $105.00 FALSE

IFB 23I-1018 Unverified Pricing



Grace Signs LLC DBA Signs Plus
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid

1 Market Basket Sample Job #1 Each $49,576.00 FALSE
2 Market Basket Sample Job #2 Each $131.38 FALSE
3 Market Basket Sample Job #3 Each $8,068.04 FALSE
4 Market Basket Sample Job #4 Each TRUE
5 Installation Labor (Lowest Rate) Pr Hr $40.00 FALSE

Norcon Industries, Inc.
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid

1 Market Basket Sample Job #1 Each $12,346.10 FALSE
2 Market Basket Sample Job #2 Each $47.08 FALSE
3 Market Basket Sample Job #3 Each $4,406.05 FALSE
4 Market Basket Sample Job #4 Each $606.60 FALSE
5 Installation Labor (Lowest Rate) Pr Hr $75.00 FALSE

Precise Sign Co
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid

1 Market Basket Sample Job #1 Each $14,269.50 FALSE
2 Market Basket Sample Job #2 Each $34.85 FALSE
3 Market Basket Sample Job #3 Each $3,201.45 FALSE
4 Market Basket Sample Job #4 Each $709.64 FALSE
5 Installation Labor (Lowest Rate) Pr Hr $45.00 FALSE
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