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Solicitation: IFB 23L-1221 – Roof and Roofing Systems 
 
Due Date: December 21, 2023 Time: 3:01 PM 
 
Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the solicitation listed. 
 

Response Information 
 

Vendor Contact Name Status Submission Date 

Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. Karen Ratliff No Bid Nov 13, 2023 9:00 AM 
CentiMark Corp. Chad Anderson Submitted Dec 20, 2023 4:12 PM 
Coit Services Sean Police No Bid Nov 13, 2023 10:16 AM 
Coughlan Companies LLC DBA Capstone Connie Ruyter No Bid Nov 13, 2023 8:40 AM 
Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles No Bid Nov 13, 2023 9:02 AM 
Deep Canyon, LLC dba 1 By 1 Roof, Solar, & Paint Tracy Miller No Bid Dec 8, 2023 1:20 PM 
Exerplay Michelle Mckean No Bid Nov 13, 2023 11:35 AM 
Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba System4 of Phoenix Susan Ricks No Bid Nov 13, 2023 1:14 PM 
GBS Books Troy Williams No Bid Nov 15, 2023 3:55 PM 
Global Roofing Group David Federly Submitted Dec 21, 2023 10:51 AM 
Interstate Mechanical Corporation Lori DeLoera No Bid Nov 13, 2023 12:37 PM 
JBS Roofing Jessica Rudd Submitted Dec 21, 2023 10:49 AM 
Marshall Best Security Corporation John Esposito No Bid Nov 13, 2023 8:52 AM 
Nippon Shokken U.S.A. Inc. Jack Kobayashi No Bid Nov 13, 2023 8:44 AM 
Norcon Industries, Inc. Lora Harvey Submitted Dec 21, 2023 11:50 AM 
Platinum Roofing Kimberly Speer Submitted Dec 21, 2023 8:43 AM 
Progressive Roofing Alice Hunt Submitted Dec 21, 2023 1:18 PM 
QCM Technologies, Inc. Zona Brandt No Bid Nov 13, 2023 7:53 PM 
Textbook Warehouse Patricia Walters No Bid Nov 13, 2023 8:38 AM 
Unipak Corp. Brian Marcus No Bid Nov 13, 2023 8:39 AM 

 
 

 

I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed. Solicitations opened via OpenGov 
Procurement.  

 

                        
  

Signed Signed 
 
                   Michael R Nentwig                                               Melissa Jimenez 

  

Printed Printed 
 
                December 21, 2023                                                    December 21, 2023 
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Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005 
Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces.  
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625 East Beale Street, Kingman, AZ 86401     Phone: (928) 753-6945     Fax: (928) 718-3232     mesc.org 
EH 7/10/20 

MESC Solicitation Opening 

 
 

Solicitation Number: 23L-1221 Roof and Roofing Systems 

Opening Date: 12/21/2023  Opening Time: 3:00 PM 

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation. 

 
Printed Name: Signature 

Michael Nentwig, CPPB 
 

Lari Staples, CPPO 
 

Michael Carter, CPPB, NIGP-CPP 
 

Melissa Jimenez 
 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

 



Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly $45.00
2 Roof Inspection Labor Hourly No Bid 
3 Roof Repair Labor Hourly $95.00
4 Travel/Drive Time Hourly $45.00

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Each $107.88
2 Roof Inspection Labor Each / Percentage $78.77
3 Roof Repair Labor Hourly $102.76
4 Travel/Drive Time Hourly $62.77

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly $95.00
2 Roof Inspection Labor Hourly $95.00
3 Roof Repair Labor Hourly $95.00
4 Travel/Drive Time Hourly $95.00

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly $75.00
2 Roof Inspection Labor Hourly No Bid
3 Roof Repair Labor Hourly No Bid
4 Travel/Drive Time Hourly $45.00

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly $73.00
2 Roof Inspection Labor Hourly $115.70
3 Roof Repair Labor Hourly $115.70
4 Travel/Drive Time Hourly $115.70

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly $95.00
2 Roof Inspection Labor Hourly $95.00
3 Roof Repair Labor Hourly $95.00
4 Travel/Drive Time Hourly $0.00

Norcon Industries, Inc.

Platinum Roofing

Progressive Roofing

Centimark Corporation
IFB 23L-1221 Roof and Roofing Systems

Global Roofing Group

JBS Roofing
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