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Solicitation: IFB 23M-0111 – Two-way Radios 
 
Due Date: January 11, 2023 Time: 3:01 PM 

 

Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the solicitation listed. 
 

Response Information 
 

Vendor Contact Name Status Submission Date 

Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. Karen Ratliff No Bid Nov 27, 2023 8:47 AM 

Air Comm Corporation Austin Derby Submitted Jan 10, 2024 2:24 PM 

Arrowhead Superior Refrigeration Se Alma Griego No Bid Nov 27, 2023 9:27 AM 

Coit Services Sean Police No Bid Nov 27, 2023 9:48 AM 

Comm-Tech, Inc kyle beauchamp Submitted Jan 11, 2024 1:27 PM 

Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles No Bid Nov 27, 2023 8:31 AM 

Discount Two-Way Radio Corporation Michelle Morris Submitted Jan 11, 2024 2:57 PM 

Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba System4 of Phoenix Susan Ricks No Bid Nov 27, 2023 8:51 AM 

GBS Books Troy Williams No Bid Nov 27, 2023 2:45 PM 

Horizon Technologies Robert Weller Submitted Jan 9, 2024 4:08 PM 

Marshall Best Security Corporation John Esposito No Bid Nov 27, 2023 8:37 AM 

QCM Technologies, Inc. Zona Brandt No Bid Nov 27, 2023 9:56 AM 

Unipak Corp. Brian Marcus No Bid Nov 27, 2023 9:02 AM 

 
 

 

I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed. Solicitations opened via OpenGov 
Procurement.  

 

                        
  

Signed Signed 

 

                   Michael R Nentwig                                               Melissa Jimenez 
  

Printed Printed 

 

                January 11, 2024                                                    January 11, 2024 
  

Date Date 

 

Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005 

Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces.  

 

Rev. 7/27/2022 MSC 



 

625 East Beale Street, Kingman, AZ 86401     Phone: (928) 753-6945     Fax: (928) 718-3232     mesc.org 

EH 7/10/20 

MESC Solicitation Opening 

 

 

Solicitation Number: 23M-0111 Two-way Radios 

Opening Date: 1/11/2024  Opening Time: 3:00 PM 

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation. 

 

Printed Name: Signature 

Michael Nentwig, CPPB 
 

Lari Staples, CPPO 
 

Michael Carter, CPPB, NIGP-CPP 
 

Melissa Jimenez 
 

Kristy Hamm 
 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

 



Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly $115.00
2 Programming Hourly $115.00
3 Shop Service / Repair Hourly $115.00
4 Technical/Engineering Service Hourly $115.00
2 Field Service (Basic) Hourly $115.00
3 Installation - Mobile - Vehicle - In Shop Hourly or Flat $200.00
4 Installation - Mobile - Vehicle - Offsite Hourly or Flat $225.00

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly No Bid
2 Programming Hourly No Bid
3 Shop Service / Repair Hourly $80.00
4 Technical/Engineering Service Hourly No Bid
2 Field Service (Basic) Hourly $200.00
3 Installation - Mobile - Vehicle - In Shop Hourly or Flat No Bid
4 Installation - Mobile - Vehicle - Offsite Hourly or Flat No Bid

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly $135.00
2 Programming Hourly $135.00
3 Shop Service / Repair Hourly $125.00
4 Technical/Engineering Service Hourly $135.00
2 Field Service (Basic) Hourly $135.00
3 Installation - Mobile - Vehicle - In Shop Hourly or Flat $135.00
4 Installation - Mobile - Vehicle - Offsite Hourly or Flat $145.00

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Hourly $125.00
2 Programming Hourly $125.00
3 Shop Service / Repair Hourly $125.00
4 Technical/Engineering Service Hourly $185.00
2 Field Service (Basic) Hourly $125.00
3 Installation - Mobile - Vehicle - In Shop Hourly or Flat $125.00
4 Installation - Mobile - Vehicle - Offsite Hourly or Flat $125.00

Air Comm Corporation
IFB 23M-0111 Two-way Radios

Comm-Tech, Inc.

Horizon Technologies, Inc.

Discount Two-Wt Radio Corporation
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