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Solicitation Number: 24G-0905 Landscaping Design, Installation, Maintenance, Irrigation, Services, and
Products

Opening Date: 9/5/2024 Opening Time: 3:00 PM

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation.
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Michael Nentwig, CPPB /’m% M

211 N 7th St, Kingman AZ 86401 Phone: (928) 753-6945  Fax: (928) 718-3232 mesc.org
MRN 11/16/23



\ SOLICITATION

l SIGN-IN SHEET

COOPERATIVE PAGE 10F1

Solicitation __24G-0905 Landscaping Design, Installation, Maintenance, Irrigation, Services

and Products
Due Date: 9/5/24 Time: 3:00 PM

Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the

solicitation listed above.

Submission
Vendor Contact Name Status Date
Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. Karen Ratliff No Bid 8/1/249:03
Arrowhead Superior Refrigeration Se Alma Griego No Bid 8/1/24 10:21
Business

Barnes & Noble Booksellers, Inc. Development Team No Bid 8/1/247:.01
Coit Services Sean Police No Bid 8/1/24 11:57
Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles No Bid 8/1/247:31

8/29/24
Environmental Planning Group, LLC Michael Park No Bid 14:07
Epifini Landscaping Inc. Antemio Pinedo Submitted 9/5/24 13:48
Evolution Mechanical Construction, LLC -
DBA IMCOR Lori DelLoera No Bid 9/3/24 14.45
Exerplay Michelle Mckean No Bid 8/1/247.02
Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba
System4 of Phoenix Susan Ricks No Bid 8/1/247:47
GBS Books Troy Williams No Bid 8/1/24 16:47
Marshall Best Security Corporation John Esposito No Bid 8/1/247:12
Nippon Shokken U.S.A. Inc. Jack Kobayashi No Bid 8/1/24 9:10
QCM Technologies, Inc. Zona Brandt No Bid 8/1/24 9:20
Savant Corp. 1800 Radiator Jim Kemmer No Bid 8/1/247:24

8/30/24
SiteOne Landscape Supply Keith McGinty Submitted 13:01
Textbook Warehouse, LLC James Adams No Bid 8/1/247:00

I hereby certify the above were received prior to the dL}e dagg and time listed:

Signed _% ' Signed __| \"Lu_‘/‘//’//ft/v,’d/‘f/}

Printed Kristy Hamm, CPPB Printed Melissa Jimenez

Date 9/5/24 Date 9/5/24

Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005
Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces.

Rev. MRN 11/16/23
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andscaping Design, Installation,
Maintenance, Irrigation, Services,

;% §w | A\/E SOLICITATION
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IFB and Products 9/5/2024 3:00 PM Kristy Hamm, CPPB
Type Solicitation Due Date Time Contract Specialist

Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the solicitation listed

above.
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Name ) Date & Time Recd Received by
Delivery Method: l:l FedEx I:l UPS D USPS\E] Other:  \m M M M
| # Packages # Binders # Loose USB  Other Information: /

Name Date & Time Recd véd by

Delivery Method: |:] FedEx I:I UPS D USPS I:I Other: r\

# Packages # Binders # Loose USB  Other Information: ZJ &
7
5 2

Name J/#’R,edi Received by
Delivery Method: |:| FedEx D UPS D USPS gl%her

# Packages # Binders # Loose | /l}ef Informatlon
Narme 3 Date & Time Recd Received by
Delivery Method: D FedEx l:] UPS PS D Other:
# Packages # Binde # Loose USB  Other Information:

1 L
v

Date & Time Recd Received by
|___| UPS D USPS I:I Other:

Name
Delivery Method: I:'Fe X

# Packages # Binders # Loose USB  Other Information:
Date & Time Recd Received by

ethod: DFedEx DUPS I:IUSPS DOther:

# Packages # Binders # Loose USB  Other Information:

/
%fﬁy the above were received prior to the due @
/ﬂ(/ L S2s

/jz KZVM Coctr TESTHER HoPE(NS
7/ (/25‘ 4\\?\\ 204

listed:

Date Date

Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005
Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces. MSC 3/14/23



24G-0905 Unverified Price List

SiteOne Landscaping Supply

Item

Description

Qty [Unit of Measure |Unit Cost

1|60 inch Pistacia Chinese's box 1|Each $0.00 S0.00
2|1/2 inch screened Apache Brown 1|Ton $61.50 $61.50
3|2 inch Schedule 40 PVC Coupling 1|Each $1.04 $1.04
4|Irrigation Design 1|Hour $0.00 S0.00
5|Trencher Operator 1|Hour $0.00 S0.00
6|General Labor 1|Hour $0.00 S0.00
7|Pre-Emergent weed control 1|Gallon $138.80| $138.80
8|Ant control granuals 1|Pound $49.20 $49.20
Mower blade sharpening (repair
9|service) 1|Hour S0.00 S0.00
Irrigation Software (single site
10|license) 1|Each S0.00 S0.00
Total $250.54

Epitini Landscaping Inc.

Line
Item

Description

Unit of Measure Unit Cost

Total

1|60 inch Pistacia Chinese's box 1|Each $3,850.00( $3,850.00
2|1/2 inch screened Apache Brown 1{Ton $120.31| $120.31
3|2 inch Schedule 40 PVC Coupling 1|Each $1.60 $1.60
4|lIrrigation Design 1{Hour $50.00| $50.00
5|Trencher Operator 1|Hour $75.63 $75.63
6|General Labor 1|Hour $35.00 $35.00
7|Pre-Emergent weed control 1|Gallon S481.25| S$481.25
8|Ant control granuals 1|Pound $35.00 $35.00
Mower blade sharpening (repair
9(service) 1|Hour $50.00 $50.00
Irrigation Software (single site
10|license) 1|Each $4,200.00| $4,200.00
Total $8,898.79
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