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Solicitation: IFB 24K-1114  Due Date: November 14, 2024 Time: 3:01 PM 
 
Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the 
solicitation listed above. 
 

Vendor Contact Name Status Submission Date 
Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. Karen Ratliff No Bid Oct 7, 2024 1:08 PM 
Arizona Recreation Design, Inc. Lindsay Nolan Submitted Nov 14, 2024 12:00 PM 

BSN Sports Chris Bloomfield Submitted Nov 13, 2024 9:55 AM 

Coit Services Sean Police No Bid Oct 7, 2024 10:03 AM 
Competitive Surfacing Solutions Casey Caniglia Submitted Nov 14, 2024 1:28 PM 
Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles Submitted Nov 13, 2024 8:21 AM 

DBSI, Inc. Suzanne Sutherland No Bid Oct 8, 2024 2:27 PM 
Desert Play Systems LLC, dba American Play Systems Maria Smith Submitted Nov 14, 2024 1:36 PM 
Desert Recreation, Inc. Scott Harter Submitted Nov 8, 2024 2:29 PM 

Exerplay Mindy Bennett Submitted Nov 14, 2024 1:29 PM 

Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba System4 of Phoenix Susan Ricks No Bid Oct 7, 2024 10:27 AM 
GBS Books Troy Williams No Bid Oct 7, 2024 12:52 PM 
Go Outdoor Amenities Kylie Pearson Submitted Nov 14, 2024 2:35 PM 

Marshall Best Security Corporation John Esposito No Bid Oct 7, 2024 11:28 AM 
Nippon Shokken U.S.A. Inc. Jack Kobayashi No Bid Oct 7, 2024 9:17 AM 
Norcon Industries, Inc. Lora Harvey Submitted Nov 14, 2024 12:35 PM 

Play It Safe Playgrounds Teri LeGassey Submitted Nov 14, 2024 7:24 AM 
PlaySpace Designs, Inc. Clif Bennett Submitted Nov 14, 2024 1:13 PM 
QCM Technologies, LLC Zona Brandt No Bid Oct 7, 2024 9:20 AM 
Textbook Warehouse, LLC James Adams No Bid Oct 7, 2024 9:22 AM 
TriActive USA Fitness Equipment Lucas Riphagen Submitted Nov 14, 2024 12:43 PM 
Unipak Corp. Brian Marcus No Bid Oct 7, 2024 9:34 AM 
Victoria McVay LLC. Christal West Submitted Nov 11, 2024 4:14 PM 
Zoom Recreation, Inc. Sergio Gallardo Submitted Nov 14, 2024 2:57 PM 

 
 

 
I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed: 

 
 

Signed           Signed   
 
 
Printed        Michael Nentwig, CPPB Printed           Melissa Jimenez, CPPB 
 
 
Date                November 14, 2024.          Date                November 14, 2024.         
 
 
 
 



 

211 N 7th St, Kingman AZ 86401     Phone: (928) 753-6945     Fax: (928) 718-3232     mesc.org 

MRN 11/16/23 

MESC Solicitation Opening 

 
 

Solicitation Number: IFB 24K-1114 

Opening Date: November 14, 2024  Opening Time: 3:01 PM 

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation. 

 
Printed Name: Signature 

Michael Nentwig, CPPB 
 

Michael S. Carter, CPPB, NIGP-CPP 
 

Melissa Jimenez, CPPB 
 

Lari Staples, CPPO 
 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

 









Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $120.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $95.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $500.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 5.00%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr No Bid
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr No Bid
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each No Bid

1 Bond Cost Occurance No Bid
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $55.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $55.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $850.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 3.50%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $115.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $115.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $115.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 3.00%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 25.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $110.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $52.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $180.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 3.50%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $250.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr No Bid
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $750.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 3.00%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $375.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $375.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $2,500.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 3.50%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 20.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $300.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $200.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $100.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 10.00%

Desert Recreation, Inc.

Exerplay

Go Outdoor Amenities

Arizona Recreation Design, Inc.
IFB 24K-1114 Playgrounds, Splash Pads, Outdoor Fitness, and Related Equipment

BSN Sports

Competitive Surfacing Solutions

Dave Bang Associates, Inc

Desert Play Systems LLC, dba American Play Systems



2 Restock Fee Occurance 10.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $60.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $50.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $850.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 1.00%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $100.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $100.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $735.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 4.00%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $55.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $17.50
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $850.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 3.00%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr No Bid
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr No Bid
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each No Bid

1 Bond Cost Occurance No Bid
2 Restock Fee Occurance No Bid

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $125.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $130.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each No Bid

1 Bond Cost Occurance No Bid
2 Restock Fee Occurance No Bid

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments
1 Installation Labor Per/Hr $225.00
2 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr $1,050.00
3 Utility Locator Service Per/Hr or Each $900.00

1 Bond Cost Occurance 10.00%
2 Restock Fee Occurance 15.00%

PlaySpace Designs, Inc.

TriActive USA Fitness Equipment

Victoria McVay LLC.

Zoom Recreation, Inc.

Norcon Industries, Inc.

Play It Safe Playgrounds
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