\l
. MESC Solicitation Opening

COOPERATIVE

Solicitation Number: |FB 24L-1203 Asphalt, Concrete, and Ancillary Services

Opening Date: 12/03/2024 Opening Time:  3:00 p.m.

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation.

Printed Name: Signature
Melissa Jimenez, CPPB SVh c’;@m’]zunu@
Michael S. Carter, CPPB, NIGP-CPP Yy N 7,j, //”d Y it o8

Kristina Hamm, CPPB

Lari Staples, CPPO COA\“, &?W

211 N 7th St, Kingman AZ 86401 Phone: (928) 753-6945  Fax: (928) 718-3232 mesc.org
MRN 11/16/23



\ SOLICITATION
l SIGN-IN SHEET
COOPERATIVE PAGE 1 OF1

Solicitation IFB 24L-1203 Asphalt, Concrete, and Related Ancillary Services
Due Date: __12/3/2024  Time:3:00 p.m.

Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the
solicitation listed above.

Vendor Contact Name Status Submission Date
1-800 Striper of South Phoenix Josh Hatch Submitted | Nov 30, 2024 1:35 PM
Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. Karen Ratliff No Bid Oct 28, 2024 12:12 PM
Cactus Asphalt Jeff Abram Submitted | Dec 3, 2024 7:15 AM
Coit Services Sean Police No Bid Oct 28, 2024 8:32 AM
Copper State Pavement Inc Jacob Kloszewski | Submitted | Dec 3, 2024 2:58 PM
Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles No Bid Oct 28, 2024 9:40 AM
Earth Resources Corporation Jordan Tacke Submitted | Dec 3, 2024 1:45 PM
Exerplay Michelle Mckean | No Bid Oct 28, 2024 9:27 AM
Expert Restaurant Supply Bob Southward No Bid Oct 29, 2024 8:53 AM
Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba System4 of Phoenix | Susan Ricks No Bid Oct 28, 2024 8:15 AM
Karber Corporation - K CORP Patrick Arthur No Bid Oct 28, 2024 8:08 AM
Marshall Best Security Corporation John Esposito No Bid Oct 28, 2024 8:24 AM
Nippon Shokken U.S.A. Inc. Jack Kobayashi No Bid Oct 28, 2024 8:22 AM
QCM Technologies, LLC Zona Brandt No Bid Oct 28, 2024 12:24 PM
Savant Corp. 1800 Radiator Jim Kemmer No Bid Oct 29, 2024 6:58 AM
Sunland Asphalt & Construction, LLC Sydney Mayberry | Submitted | Dec 3, 2024 12:45 PM
Textbook Warehouse, LLC James Adams No Bid Oct 28, 2024 8:15 AM
Unipak Corp. Brian Marcus No Bid Oct 28, 2024 8:32 AM
Weems Asphalt Craig Weems Submitted | Dec 3, 2024 8:44 AM
YSC Paving, Inc. Nate Arterburn Submitted | Dec 3, 2024 2:54 PM

I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed:
N 2 R b
Signed [ \Vf':-v L'(//'//gu‘* Lu‘?’} Signed %

Printed Melissa Jimenez Printed __ Kristina Hamm

Date 12/3/2024 Date 12/3/2024

Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005
Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces. Rev. MRN 11/16/23



N % % LI AN/ SOLICITATION
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COOPERATIVE PAGE! __OF |

241.-1203 Asphalt, Concrete, and

IFB Related Ancillary Services 12/03/2024 3:00 p.m. Melissa Jimenez
Type Solicitation Due Date Time Contract Specialist

Mt?gave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the solicitation listed
above

Weemns, Re s\t W2l 24 \“*‘—39
Name Date & Time Recd Received by
Delivery Method: I:I FedEx UPS\EI USPS D Other:
) # Packages # Binders # Loose USB  Other Information:
oA
“inleune fedndt (G N\ 1215 ()
Name Daa‘e & Tirme Rec'd Reveived by
Delivery Method: D FedEx D UPS ‘JSPS I:] Cther:
# Packages #Binders _____ # Loose USB  Other Information:
o \3lay 4o
Name Date & Time Rec'd Received by
Delivery Method: I:I FedEx l:l UPS ]Z/USPS |:| Other:
\ # Packages #Binders __ # Loose USB  Other Information:

Delivery Method: l:IFedEx I:]UPS I:IUSPS I]/Other

\ # Packages # Binders ____ # Loose USB  Other Informatlon
Gron Manage meat Tnc  [adaley nye @)
Name Date & Time Rec'd Received by
Delivery Method: I:l FedEx D UPS B/SPS |:| Other:
l # Packages # Binders # Loose USB  Other Information: P -
z () 4 /J/"Vbﬂ
=

I =i Date & Time Recd Received by
UpPs I:I USPS |:| Other:

# Bmders

# Loose USB  Other Information:

M&r the above were received prior to the due date and time listed:

ngn Signed
Pnnted Printed

Z/ RS ’
Date ’}// Date

Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005
Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces. MSC 3/14/23



1-800 Striper of South Phoenix

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total
1 General Labor Rate 1 Hour $200.00 $200.00
2 Demo and Haul Asphalt, Cubic Yard
Dirt, Etc. (Cubic yard of
material)
3 Asphalt Surface Patch Square Foot
4 Asphalt Overlay (2-inch Square Foot
depth)
5 Slurry Seal (0 - 100,000 Square Foot
square feet)
6 Slurry Seal (over 100,000 Square Foot
square feet)
7 Concrete Flatwork (4- Square Foot
inch thick per square
foot)
8 Concrete Single Curb (1- Linear Foot
200 linear feet)
9 Concrete Wheel Stops 1 Each $120.00 $120.00
(6-feet in length)
10 Striping (4-inch width 1 Linear Foot $0.14 $0.14
restripe)
Total $320.14

Cactus Asphalt

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total

1 General Labor Rate 1 Hour $35.00 $35.00

2 Demo and Haul Asphalt, 1 Cubic Yard $35.00 $35.00
Dirt, Etc. (Cubic yard of
material)

3 Asphalt Surface Patch 1 Square Foot $2.25 $2.25

4 Asphalt Overlay (2-inch 1 Square Foot $1.95 $1.95
depth)

5 Slurry Seal (0 - 100,000 1 Square Foot $0.57 $0.57
square feet)

6 Slurry Seal (over 100,000 1 Square Foot $0.48 $0.48
square feet)

7 Concrete Flatwork (4- 1 Square Foot $24.00 $24.00
inch thick per square
foot)

8 Concrete Single Curb (1- 1 Linear Foot $45.00 $45.00
200 linear feet)

9 Concrete Wheel Stops 1 Each $175.00 $175.00
(6-feet in length)

10 Striping (4-inch width 1 Linear Foot $0.53 $0.53
restripe)

Total $319.78



Line Item

10

Line Item

10

Description

General Labor Rate

Demo and Haul Asphalt,
Dirt, Etc. (Cubic yard of
material)

Asphalt Surface Patch

Asphalt Overlay (2-inch
depth)

Slurry Seal (0 - 100,000
square feet)

Slurry Seal (over 100,000
square feet)

Concrete Flatwork (4-
inch thick per square
foot)

Concrete Single Curb (1-
200 linear feet)

Concrete Wheel Stops
(6-feet in length)

Striping (4-inch width
restripe)

Total

Description

General Labor Rate

Demo and Haul Asphalt,
Dirt, Etc. (Cubic yard of
material)

Asphalt Surface Patch

Asphalt Overlay (2-inch
depth)

Slurry Seal (0 - 100,000
square feet)

Slurry Seal (over 100,000
square feet)

Concrete Flatwork (4-
inch thick per square
foot)

Concrete Single Curb (1-
200 linear feet)

Concrete Wheel Stops
(6-feet in length)

Striping (4-inch width
restripe)

Total

Quantity

Quantity

Copper State Pavement Inc

Unit of Measure

Hour

Cubic Yard

Square Foot

Square Foot

Square Foot

Square Foot

Square Foot

Linear Foot

Each

Linear Foot

Unit of Measure

Hour

Cubic Yard

Square Foot

Square Foot

Square Foot

Square Foot

Square Foot

Linear Foot

Each

Linear Foot

Unit Cost

Earth Resources Corporation

Unit Cost

$35.00

$35.06

$1.40

$1.91

$0.73

$0.73

$7.38

$29.27

$55.83

$0.19

$35.00

$75.00

$4.92

$1.80

$0.45

$0.44

$12.25

$77.00

$135.00

$1.61

Total

$35.00

$35.06

$1.40

$1.91

$0.73

$0.73

$7.38

$29.27

$55.83

$0.19

$167.50

Total

$35.00

$75.00

$4.92

$1.80

$0.45

$0.44

$12.25

$77.00

$135.00

$1.61

$343.47



Sunland Asphalt & Construction, LLC

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total

1 General Labor Rate 1 Hour $135.00 $135.00

2 Demo and Haul Asphalt, 1 Cubic Yard $53.273 $53.273
Dirt, Etc. (Cubic yard of
material)

3 Asphalt Surface Patch 1 Square Foot $2.068 $2.068

4 Asphalt Overlay (2-inch 1 Square Foot $1.642 $1.642
depth)

5 Slurry Seal (0 - 100,000 1 Square Foot $0.349 $0.349
square feet)

6 Slurry Seal (over 100,000 1 Square Foot $0.327 $0.327
square feet)

7 Concrete Flatwork (4- 1 Square Foot $10.511 $10.511
inch thick per square
foot)

8 Concrete Single Curb (1- 1 Linear Foot $36.842 $36.842
200 linear feet)

9 Concrete Wheel Stops 1 Each $101.652 $101.652
(6-feet in length)

10 Striping (4-inch width 1 Linear Foot $0.211 $0.211
restripe)
Total $341.875

Weems Asphalt

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total

1 General Labor Rate 1 Hour $75.00 $75.00

2 Demo and Haul Asphalt, 1 Cubic Yard $70.00 $70.00
Dirt, Etc. (Cubic yard of
material)

3 Asphalt Surface Patch 1 Square Foot $1.50 $1.50

4 Asphalt Overlay (2-inch 1 Square Foot $2.45 $2.45
depth)

5 Slurry Seal (0 - 100,000 1 Square Foot $0.85 $0.85
square feet)

6 Slurry Seal (over 100,000 1 Square Foot $0.55 $0.55
square feet)

7 Concrete Flatwork (4- 1 Square Foot $20.00 $20.00
inch thick per square
foot)

8 Concrete Single Curb (1- 1 Linear Foot $70.00 $70.00
200 linear feet)

9 Concrete Wheel Stops 1 Each $180.00 $180.00
(6-feet in length)

10 Striping (4-inch width 1 Linear Foot $0.35 $0.35
restripe)

Total $420.70



YSC Paving, Inc.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total

1 General Labor Rate 1 Hour $40.00 $40.00

2 Demo and Haul Asphalt, 1 Cubic Yard $151.96 $151.96
Dirt, Etc. (Cubic yard of
material)

3 Asphalt Surface Patch 1 Square Foot $7,628.85 $7,628.85

4 Asphalt Overlay (2-inch 1 Square Foot $8.05 $8.05
depth)

5 Slurry Seal (0 - 100,000 1 Square Foot $6.96 $6.96
square feet)

6 Slurry Seal (over 100,000 1 Square Foot $4.64 $4.64
square feet)

7 Concrete Flatwork (4- 1 Square Foot $33.56 $33.56
inch thick per square
foot)

8 Concrete Single Curb (1- 1 Linear Foot $141.72 $141.72
200 linear feet)

9 Concrete Wheel Stops 1 Each $92.80 $92.80
(6-feet in length)

10 Striping (4-inch width 1 Linear Foot $0.23 $0.23
restripe)

Total $8,108.77
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