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COOPERATIVE

Solicitation Number: IFB 24M-1205

Opening Date: December 5, 2024 Opening Time: 3:01 PM

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation.

Printed Name: Signature

Michael R Nentwig, CPPB mg N

Michael S. Carter, CPPB, NIGP-CPP L ) A s
. . 4 /C .

Melissa Jimenez, CPPB N /w; af/)

Lari Staples, CPPO E(lw \3‘3"“}
Terra Hardcastle %

211 N 7th St, Kingman AZ 86401  Phone: (928) 753-6945  Fax: (928) 718-3232  mesc.org
MRN 11/16/23
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\ SOLICITATION

l SIGN-IN SHEET
COOPERATIVE PAGE10F1

Solicitation IFB 24M-1205 Due Date: December 5, 2024 Time: 3:00 PM

Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the

solicitation listed above.

Vendor Contact Name Status Submission Date
Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. Karen Ratliff No Bid Oct 30, 2024 8:47 AM
Andrew's Construction, inc Paul Rapuano Submitted Dec 5, 2024 12:16 AM
Coit Services Sean Police No Bid Oct 30, 2024 8:48 AM
Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles No Bid Oct 30, 2024 8:42 AM
Evolution Mechanical Construction, LLC - DBA IMCOR Lori DeLoera No Bid Oct 30, 2024 8:19 PM
Exerplay Michelle Mckean No Bid Oct 30, 2024 9:13 AM
Expert Restaurant Supply Bob Southward No Bid Oct 30, 2024 10:25 AM
Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba System4 of Phoenix | Susan Ricks No Bid Oct 30, 2024 9:02 AM
GBS Books Troy Williams No Bid Dec 2, 2024 1:18 PM
Ghaster Painting & Coatings, Inc. Ginger Morton Submitted Nov 27, 2024 7:29 AM
Go To Services inc Rafael Sanchez Submitted Dec 5, 2024 9:12 AM
Marshall Best Security Corporation John Esposito No Bid Oct 30, 2024 8:57 AM
Nippon Shokken U.S.A. Inc. Jack Kobayashi No Bid Oct 30, 2024 6:43 PM
QCM Technologies, LLC Zona Brandt No Bid Nov 5, 2024 5:50 PM
Riddle Painting and Coatings, CO Tricia Smidt Submitted Dec 4, 2024 2:44 PM
Royalty Sealants L.L.C. ALFONSO LOPEZ Submitted Dec 4, 2024 12:44 AM
Savant Corp. 1800 Radiator Jim Kemmer No Bid Oct 30, 2024 8:49 AM
Skyline Builders & Restoration Mike Lee Submitted Dec 5, 2024 7:15 AM
Textbook Warehouse, LLC James Adams No Bid Oct 30, 2024 9:04 AM
Unipak Corp. Brian Marcus No Bid Oct 30, 2024 9:25 AM

I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed:

D

PHRESG e e
Signed: signed: VLA AN )

Printed: Michael R Nentwig, CPPB Printed: Melissa Jimenez, CPPB

Date: December 5, 2024 Date: December 5, 2024

Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005
Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces. Rev. MRN 11/16/23



IFB 24M-1205 Exterior/Interior Painting, Weatherization, and Other Coating Applications

Andrew's Construction, inc

Line Item Unit of Measure
1 General Labor / Apprentice Per/Hr $59.00
2 Foreman Per/Hr $79.00
3 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr or Each $79.00
1 Bond Cost Per Project 2.00%

2 Credit Card / Pcard Processini Fee Per ProI'ect 3.00%

Ghaster Painting & Coatings, Inc.

Line Item ipti Unit of Measure
1 General Labor / Apprentice Per/Hr $60.00
2 Foreman Per/Hr $60.00
3 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr or Each $60.00
1 Bond Cost Per Project 2.50%
2 Credit Card / Pcard Processing Fee Per Project 3.00%

Go To Services inc

Unit of Measure

1 General Labor / Apprentice ~ Per/Hr $75.00
2 Foreman Per/Hr $105.00
3 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr or Each $65.00
. _________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________|
1 Bond Cost Per Project 3.00%
2 Credit Card / Pcard Processing Fee Per Project 3.50%

Riddle Painting and Coatings, CO

Line Item ipti Unit of Measure
1 General Labor / Apprentice Per/Hr $40.00
2 Foreman Per/Hr $50.00
3 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr or Each $30.00
1 Bond Cost Per Project 2.50%
2 Credit Card / Pcard Processing Fee Per Project 3.00%

Royalty Sealants L.L.C.

Line Item Description Unit of Measure
1 General Labor / Apprentice Per/Hr $45.00
2 Foreman Per/Hr $50.00
3 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr or Each $50.00
1 Bond Cost Per Project 3.00%
2 Credit Card / Pcard Processing Fee Per Project 3.00%

line Builders & Restoration

Line Item ipti Unit of Measure
1 General Labor / Apprentice Per/Hr $48.35
2 Foreman Per/Hr $55.00
3 Travel/Drive Time Per/Hr or Each $28.55
. _________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________|
1 Bond Cost Per Project 3.00%

2 Credit Card / Pcard Processing Fee Per Project 0.00%
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