
Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005 

Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces.        Rev. MRN 11/16/23 

SOLICITATION  
SIGN-IN SHEET 

PAGE 1 OF 1 

Solicitation: IFB 25H-0821  Due Date: August 21, 2025 Time: 3:00 PM 

Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the 
solicitation listed above. 

Vendor Contact Name Status Submission Date 

Adams Fence LLC Angelica Yguado Submitted Aug 19, 2025 2:21 PM 

Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. Karen Ratliff No Bid Jul 14, 2025 12:17 PM 

Associated Fence Ryan Blauvelt Submitted Aug 20, 2025 11:59 AM 

Biddle & Brown Fence Co Brandon Cromer Submitted Aug 21, 2025 9:02 AM 

Competitive Edge Contracting Casey Caiglia Submitted Aug 21, 2025 2:04 PM 

Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles No Bid Jul 14, 2025 8:55 AM 

Design Modulars, Inc. Katrina Olivas No Bid Jul 14, 2025 1:48 PM 

Diamond Iron, LLC Chris Blauvelt Submitted August 21, 2025 1:35 PM 

Exerplay Michelle Mckean No Bid Jul 14, 2025 9:24 AM 

Expert Restaurant Supply Bob Southward No Bid Jul 15, 2025 8:55 AM 

Filterbuy Incorporated Chelsea Gayden No Bid Jul 14, 2025 11:15 AM 

Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba System4 of Phoenix Susan Ricks No Bid Jul 14, 2025 10:10 AM 

Hurricane Fence Company Kirby Reinhardt Submitted Aug 18, 2025 10:46 PM 

Liberty Fence and Supply Danielle Hammons Submitted Aug 20, 2025 4:34 PM 

Marshall Best Security Corporation John Esposito No Bid Jul 14, 2025 11:24 AM 

Nippon Shokken U.S.A. Inc. Jack Kobayashi No Bid Jul 14, 2025 8:59 AM 

Phoenix Fence Company Bryan Zeigler No Bid Aug 21, 2025 11:22 AM 

QCM Technologies, LLC Zona Brandt No Bid Jul 14, 2025 11:03 AM 

Regal Fence LLC Matt Blauvelt Submitted Aug 20, 2025 4:02 PM 

Savant Corp. 1800 Radiator Jim Kemmer No Bid Jul 14, 2025 9:09 AM 

Textbook Warehouse, LLC James Adams No Bid Jul 14, 2025 8:53 AM 

Western Fence Co. Cameron Nottke Submitted Aug 21, 2025 12:03 PM 

I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed: 

Signed:  Signed:  

Printed: Michael R Nentwig, CPPB Printed: _Melissa Jimenez, CPPB_________ 

Date:  August 21, 2025  Date:   August 21, 2025 







Adams Fence LLC
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost

1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $137.50
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $95.95
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $146.45
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $181.80
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $60.60

Associated Fence
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost

1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $35.00
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $40.00
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $60.00
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $125.00
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $50.00

Biddle & Brown Fence Co.
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost

1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $50.00
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $85.31
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $102.37
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $150.00
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $150.00

Competitive Edge Contracting
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost

1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $35.00
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $55.00
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $75.00
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $50.00
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $50.00

Diamond Iron, LLC
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost

1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $0.00
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $65.25
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $98.00
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $0.00
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $0.00

Hurricane Fence Company
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost

1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $57.00
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $44.00
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $142.00
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $250.00
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $65.00

Liberty Fence and Supply



Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost
1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $44.00
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $71.00
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $142.00
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $250.00
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $65.00

Regal Fence LLC
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost

1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $87.50
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $87.50
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $150.00
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $750.00
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $150.00

Western Fence Co.
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost

1 Travel / Drive Rates Per Hour $60.00
2 General Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $60.00
3 Emergency Labor/Service Rate Per Hour $90.00
4 Professional Services - Engineering Per Hour $0.00
5 Professional Services - Design Per Hour $0.00
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