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Solicitation Number: IFB 25P-1118 Pre-Engineered Fabric Shade Structures

Opening Date: November 18, 2025 Opening Time: 3:00 p.m.

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation.
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Solicitation_1FB 25P-1118 Pre-Engineered Fabric Shade Structures
Time: 3:00 p.m.

Due Date: November 18, 2025
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Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the

solicitation listed above.

IFB 25P-1118 Solicitation Sign-In Sheet

Vendor Contact Name Status Submission Date
Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. Karen Ratliff No Bid Oct 20, 2025 11:41
Arizona Awnings & Canvas, LLC, DBA PAPPA TIM PAPPAS Submitted Ql\)ﬂv 14, 2025 8:05 PM
Arizona Recreation Design, Inc. Lindsay Nolan Submitted | Nov 18, 2025 1:48 PM
Dave Bang Associates, Inc Shanna Liles Submitted | Nov 16, 2025 6:35 PM
Exerplay Michelle Submitted | Nov 18, 2025 9:35 AM
Mckean
Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba System4 of Phoenix | Susan Ricks No Bid Oct 20, 2025 8:13 AM
GBS Books Troy Williams No Bid Oct 20, 2025 2:03 PM
Marshall Best Security Corporation John Esposito | No Bid Oct 20, 2025 9:11 AM
Play It Safe Playgrounds Jordan Lynde Submitted | Nov 18, 2025 7:44 AM
QCM Technologies, LLC Zona Brandt No Bid Oct 20, 2025 2:19 PM
SHADE Industries Ashley Submitted | Nov 18, 2025 8:16 AM
Carmona
Shade 'N Net of Arizona, Inc Angel Elder Submitted | Nov 18, 2025 12:42
Shade Structures Inc. Kalynne Allers Submitted EIIXIV 18, 2025 1:26 PM
Textbook Warehouse, LLC James Adams No Bid Oct 20, 2025 8:02 AM
Zoom Recreation, Inc. Garret Kloeppel | Submitted | Nov 18, 2025 2:19 PM

I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed:
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L Jymurt)
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Signed Signed
Printed _ Christina Ulman Printed
Date 11/18/2025 Date

Melissa Jimenez, CPPB

11/18/2025

Note: Sign-in sheet complies with format suggested by representatives of the Arizona Auditor General’s office on March 9, 2005

Mohave staff will initial each entry and note the last response received, lining out the remaining spaces.

Rev. MRN 11/26/24



Unverified Pricing IFB 25P-1118
Arizona Awnings & Canvas, LLC, DBA PAPPA

Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost
1 General Labor Total $22.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $30.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $22.00 FALSE
Bidder: Arizona Recreation Design, Inc.
1 General Labor Total $125.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $172.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $130.00 FALSE
Bidder: Dave Bang Associates, Inc.
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
1 General Labor Total $115.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $115.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $115.00 FALSE
Bidder: Exerplay
1 General Labor Total $50.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $100.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $100.00 FALSE
Bidder: Play It Safe Playgrounds
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
1 General Labor Total $100.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $100.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $520.00 FALSE
Bidder: SHADE Industries
1 General Labor Total $65.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $109.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $32.50 FALSE
Bidder: Shade 'N Net of Arizona, Inc.
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid
1 General Labor Total $75.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $100.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $38.00 FALSE
Bidder: Shade Structures Inc.
1 General Labor Total $30.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $30.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $35.00 FALSE
Bidder: Zoom Recreation, Inc.
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost
1 General Labor Total $120.00 FALSE
2 Supervisor/Foreman Total $150.00 FALSE
3 Travel Time (Per Employee) Total $250.00 FALSE




