
 

211 N 7th St, Kingman AZ 86401     Phone: (928) 753-6945     Fax: (928) 718-3232     mesc.org 

MRN 11/26/24 

MESC Solicitation Opening 

 
 

Solicitation 
Number: 

25S-0723 

Opening 
Date: 

July 23, 2025  Opening Time: 3:00 p.m. 

Witnesses: We, the undersigned, witnessed the opening of the above dated sealed solicitation. 

 
Printed Name: Signature 

Mandy Prestine 
 

Michael Carter 
 

Melissa Jimenez, CPPB 
 

Michael Nentwig, CPPB 
 

Christina Ulman 
 

  

  

 



Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the solicitation listed
above.
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Solicitation IFB 25S-0723 Due Date: July 23, 2025 Time: 3:00 p.m.  
 
Mohave Educational Services Cooperative, Inc. has received the following responses to the 
solicitation listed above. 
Vendor Status Submission Date 
Advanced Structural Engineering, Inc. No Bid Jun 25, 2025 12:19 

PM 
Dave Bang Associates, Inc No Bid Jun 25, 2025 9:29 

AM 
Epifini Landscaping Inc. Submitted Jul 22, 2025 1:50 PM 
Exerplay No Bid Jun 25, 2025 8:54 

AM 
Expert Restaurant Supply No Bid Jun 25, 2025 9:04 

AM 
Filterbuy Incorporated No Bid Jun 25, 2025 5:34 

PM 
Flying Squirrel Enterprises, Inc dba System4 of 
Phoenix 

No Bid Jun 25, 2025 8:55 
AM 

GBS Books No Bid Jun 25, 2025 11:36 
AM 

Nippon Shokken U.S.A. Inc. No Bid Jun 25, 2025 2:24 
PM 

Outdoor Systems Management LLC Submitted Jul 23, 2025 2:51 PM 
QCM Technologies, LLC No Bid Jun 25, 2025 9:39 

AM 
Savant Corp. 1800 Radiator No Bid Jun 25, 2025 4:25 

PM 
Simplot AB Retail Inc. No Bid Jun 26, 2025 6:55 

AM 
Textbook Warehouse, LLC No Bid Jun 25, 2025 8:54 

AM 
Titan Landscape Services Submitted Jul 22, 2025 8:48 AM 
Whole Hearted Pro AV No Bid Jun 25, 2025 8:58 

AM 
 

 
I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed: 

 

Signed  ______ ________ Signed  ___ ____ 
 
Printed _ Christina Ulman__ Printed __ ___Mandy Prestine___________ 
 
Date   _07/23/25_______________  Date   ___07/23/25___________________  
 
 
 



Line Item Description Unit of Measure Cost Comments

Epifini Landscaping Inc. Response
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost

1 Bond Rate: The percentage of project total used to calculate performance bonding costs.Percentage 10.00$        
2 General Labor Hourly Rate Per Hour 38.50$        
3 Supervisor Hourly Rate Per Hour 38.50$        
4 Travel/Drive Rates: General Labor per hour Per Hour 30.25$        
5 Travel/Drive Rates: Supervisor per hour Per Hour 30.25$        

Outdoor Systems Management LLC Response
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost

1 Bond Rate: The percentage of project total used to calculate performance bonding costs.Percentage 3.00$         
2 General Labor Hourly Rate Per Hour 55.00$        
3 Supervisor Hourly Rate Per Hour 150.00$      
4 Travel/Drive Rates: General Labor per hour Per Hour 55.00$        
5 Travel/Drive Rates: Supervisor per hour Per Hour 150.00$      

Titan Landscape Services Response
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost

1 Bond Rate: The percentage of project total used to calculate performance bonding costs.Percentage 0.03$         
2 General Labor Hourly Rate Per Hour 45.00$        
3 Supervisor Hourly Rate Per Hour 65.00$        
4 Travel/Drive Rates: General Labor per hour Per Hour 45.00$        
5 Travel/Drive Rates: Supervisor per hour Per Hour 65.00$        

IFB 25S-0723 Landscaping Services
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